
Sign Bid Request for Leavenworth County
2025 Bid Tabulation

Custom Products     Jackson,
MS

Welborn Sales
Salina, KS

Barco Municipal
Ottawa, KS

National Sign Co
Ottawa, KS

Osburn Associates
Logan, OH

Lightle Enterprises
Frankfort, OH

Vulcan Signs
Foley, AL

Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total

High Intensity Prismatic reflective Faces P/S Our Bid Qty
Submitted

Bid
Submitted

Bid
Submitted

Bid
Submitted

Bid
W1-1R 30"x30" Turn Right Black/Yellow 8 $ 13.08 $ 104.64 $ 13.99 $ 111.92 $ 16.65 $ 133.20 $ 16.00 $ 128.00 $ 11.38 $ 91.04 $ 13.88 $ 111.04 $ 15.19 $ 121.52

W1-1L 30"x30" Turn Left Black/Yellow 5 $ 13.08 $ 65.40 $ 13.99 $ 69.95 $ 16.65 $ 83.25 $ 16.00 $ 80.00 $ 11.38 $ 56.90 $ 13.88 $ 69.40 $ 15.19 $ 75.95

W1-2R 30"x30" Curve right Black/Yellow 10 $ 13.08 $ 130.80 $ 13.99 $ 139.90 $ 16.65 $ 166.50 $ 16.00 $ 160.00 $ 11.38 $ 113.80 $ 13.88 $ 138.80 $ 15.19 $ 151.90

W1-2L 30"x30" Curve Left Black/Yellow 10 $ 13.08 $ 130.80 $ 13.99 $ 139.90 $ 16.65 $ 166.50 $ 16.00 $ 160.00 $ 11.38 $ 113.80 $ 13.88 $ 138.80 $ 15.19 $ 151.90

W1-5L 30"x30" Windy Road Left Black/Yellow 6 $ 13.08 $ 78.48 $ 13.99 $ 83.94 $ 16.65 $ 99.90 $ 16.00 $ 96.00 $ 11.38 $ 68.28 $ 13.88 $ 83.28 $ 15.19 $ 91.14

W1-6 Single Arrow 24"x48" black/yellow 4 5 $ 19.41 $ 97.05 $ 16.42 $ 65.68 $ 21.85 $ 87.40 $ 21.00 $ 84.00 $ 14.56 $ 58.24 $ 17.76 $ 71.04 $ 19.44 $ 77.76

W1-7 Double Arrow 24"x48" black/yellow 4 5 $ 19.41 $ 97.05 $ 16.42 $ 65.68 $ 21.85 $ 87.40 $ 21.00 $ 84.00 $ 14.56 $ 58.24 $ 17.76 $ 71.04 $ 19.44 $ 77.76

W1-8 Chevron 18"x24" black/yellow 14 $ 6.46 $ 90.44 $ 9.40 $ 131.60 $ 8.15 $ 114.10 $ 7.80 $ 109.20 $ 5.46 $ 76.44 $ 6.66 $ 93.24 $ 7.29 $ 102.06

W2-1 Cross Road 30"x30" black/yellow 4 5 $ 13.08 $ 65.40 $ 14.01 $ 56.04 $ 16.65 $ 66.60 $ 16.00 $ 64.00 $ 11.38 $ 45.52 $ 13.88 $ 55.52 $ 15.19 $ 60.76

W3-1 Stop Ahead 30"x30" black/yellow/red 15 $ 20.39 $ 305.85 $ 23.33 $ 349.95 $ 25.00 $ 375.00 $ 24.00 $ 360.00 $ 11.38 $ 170.70 $ 13.88 $ 208.20 $ 16.56 $ 248.40

W3-5 Reduce Speed 30mph 36"x36" black/yellow/white 8 $ 24.69 $ 197.52 $ 21.31 $ 170.48 $ 37.45 $ 299.60 $ 36.00 $ 288.00 $ 16.38 $ 131.04 $ 22.50 $ 180.00 $ 29.13 $ 233.04

W8-3 Pavement Ends 30"x30" black/yellow 18 $ 13.08 $ 235.44 $ 14.01 $ 252.18 $ 16.65 $ 299.70 $ 16.00 $ 288.00 $ 11.38 $ 204.84 $ 13.88 $ 249.84 $ 15.19 $ 273.42

W14-2 30"x30" No Outlet black/yellow 15 $ 13.08 $ 196.20 $ 13.99 $ 209.85 $ 16.65 $ 249.75 $ 16.00 $ 240.00 $ 11.38 $ 170.70 $ 13.88 $ 208.20 $ 15.19 $ 227.85

OM-3L 12"x36" black/yellow 50 $ 6.46 $ 323.00 $ 9.39 $ 469.50 $ 8.15 $ 407.50 $ 7.80 $ 390.00 $ 11.38 $ 569.00 $ 6.66 $ 333.00 $ 7.29 $ 364.50

OM-3R 12"x36" black/yellow 50 $ 6.46 $ 323.00 $ 9.39 $ 469.50 $ 8.15 $ 407.50 $ 7.80 $ 390.00 $ 5.46 $ 273.00 $ 6.66 $ 333.00 $ 7.29 $ 364.50

18"x18" blank red 10 $ 5.43 $ 54.30 $ 5.51 $ 55.10 $ 7.30 $ 73.00 $ 7.00 $ 70.00 $ 5.46 $ 54.60 $ 5.00 $ 50.00 $ 5.47 $ 54.70

18"x24" blank black/white 15 $ 6.46 $ 96.90 $ 15.56 $ 233.40 $ 8.15 $ 122.25 $ 7.80 $ 117.00 $ 4.10 $ 61.50 $ 6.66 $ 99.90 $ 7.29 $ 109.35

R1-1 30" Stop White/Red 50 $ 12.71 $ 635.50 $ 13.99 $ 699.50 $ 14.69 $ 734.50 $ 14.00 $ 700.00 $ 11.38 $ 569.00 $ 13.88 $ 694.00 $ 15.19 $ 759.50

R2-1 Speed Limit 24"x30" Black/White 20 $ 10.70 $ 214.00 $ 12.22 $ 244.40 $ 13.55 $ 271.00 $ 13.00 $ 260.00 $ 9.10 $ 182.00 $ 11.10 $ 222.00 $ 12.15 $ 243.00

No Numbers on sign face
R12-1 Weight Limit 24"x30" Black/White 30 $ 11.75 $ 352.50 $ 12.22 $ 366.60 $ 13.55 $ 406.50 $ 13.00 $ 390.00 $ 9.10 $ 273.00 $ 11.10 $ 333.00 $ 25.85 $ 775.50

M1-6  Route Marker blue/yellow 24" 15 $ 16.97 $ 254.55 $ 14.25 $ 213.75 $ 16.65 $ 249.75 $ 16.00 $ 240.00 $ 7.28 $ 109.20 $ 10.40 $ 156.00 $ 20.68 $ 310.20

M5-1L turn left blue/yellow 15"x21" 10 $ 6.75 $ 67.50 $ 11.67 $ 116.70 $ 13.55 $ 135.50 $ 13.00 $ 130.00 $ 3.97 $ 39.70 $ 5.70 $ 57.00 $ 11.32 $ 113.20

M5-1R turn left blue/yellow 15"x21" 10 $ 6.75 $ 67.50 $ 11.67 $ 116.70 $ 13.55 $ 135.50 $ 13.00 $ 130.00 $ 3.97 $ 39.70 $ 5.70 $ 57.00 $ 11.32 $ 113.20

Metal 0.08 Aluminum

24"x48" 4 holes 8 $ 32.82 $ 262.56 $ 27.95 $ 223.60 $ 25.90 $ 207.20 $ 24.89 $ 199.12 $ 23.04 $ 184.32 $ 27.60 $ 220.80 $ 29.15 $ 233.20

21"x15" 2 holes 20 $ 9.14 $ 182.80 $ 9.00 $ 180.00 $ 7.10 $ 142.00 $ 6.80 $ 136.00 $ 6.28 $ 125.60 $ 7.56 $ 151.20 $ 8.74 $ 174.80

9"x24" no holes 80 $ 6.41 $ 512.80 $ 6.28 $ 502.40 $ 4.90 $ 392.00 $ 4.67 $ 373.60 $ 4.32 $ 345.60 $ 5.18 $ 414.40 $ 6.13 $ 490.40

9"x30" no holes 30 $ 8.02 $ 240.60 $ 7.47 $ 224.10 $ 6.10 $ 183.00 $ 5.83 $ 174.90 $ 5.40 $ 162.00 $ 6.46 $ 193.80 $ 7.65 $ 229.50

12"x6" 2 holes 70 $ 2.29 $ 160.30 $ 3.67 $ 256.90 $ 1.50 $ 105.00 $ 1.40 $ 98.00 $ 1.44 $ 100.80 $ 1.80 $ 126.00 $ 2.00 $ 140.00

30" Stop 2 holes 50 $ 24.41 $ 1,220.50 $ 20.74 $ 1,037.00 $ 18.75 $ 937.50 $ 18.00 $ 900.00 $ 18.00 $ 900.00 $ 21.20 $ 1,060.00 $ 21.60 $ 1,080.00

18"x24" 2 holes 30 $ 12.37 $ 371.10 $ 11.58 $ 347.40 $ 9.75 $ 292.50 $ 9.33 $ 279.90 $ 8.64 $ 259.20 $ 10.35 $ 310.50 $ 10.88 $ 326.40

24"x30" 2 holes 60 $ 20.51 $ 1,230.60 $ 17.89 $ 1,073.40 $ 16.20 $ 972.00 $ 15.55 $ 933.00 $ 14.40 $ 864.00 $ 17.25 $ 1,035.00 $ 18.54 $ 1,112.40

30"x30" 4 holes Punched for diamond and Square 90 $ 25.64 $ 2,307.60 $ 22.41 $ 2,016.90 $ 20.25 $ 1,822.50 $ 19.44 $ 1,749.60 $ 18.00 $ 1,620.00 $ 21.56 $ 1,940.40 $ 23.17 $ 2,085.30

18"x18" 4 Holes Punched for diamond and Square 40 $ 9.41 $ 376.40 $ 9.78 $ 391.20 $ 7.30 $ 292.00 $ 7.00 $ 280.00 $ 6.48 $ 259.20 $ 7.76 $ 310.40 $ 8.26 $ 330.40

24" Route Marker M1-6 2 holes 15 $ 19.52 $ 292.80 $ 14.74 $ 221.10 $ 17.70 $ 265.50 $ 17.00 $ 255.00 $ 11.52 $ 172.80 $ 14.30 $ 214.50 $ 13.32 $ 199.80

12"x36" 2 holes 50 $ 12.37 $ 618.50 $ 11.58 $ 579.00 $ 9.75 $ 487.50 $ 9.33 $ 466.50 $ 8.64 $ 432.00 $ 10.35 $ 517.50 $ 11.60 $ 580.00

24"x24" 4 holes punched for diamond and square 20 $ 16.47 $ 329.40 $ 15.31 $ 306.20 $ 12.95 $ 259.00 $ 12.44 $ 248.80 $ 11.52 $ 230.40 $ 13.80 $ 276.00 $ 14.51 $ 290.20

36"x36" 4 holes punched for diamond and square 10 $ 36.92 $ 369.20 $ 31.11 $ 311.10 $ 29.15 $ 291.50 $ 28.00 $ 280.00 $ 25.92 $ 259.20 $ 11.90 $ 119.00 $ 33.08 $ 330.80

Rubber Stacker Stand Dsb100 12 $ 121.35 $ 1,456.20 $ 102.20 $ 1,226.40 $ 83.20 $ 998.40 $ 80.00 $ 960.00 NO BID NO BID $ 112.50 $ 1,350.00 NO BID NO BID

Galvanized round post 12' 2 3/8" 48 $ 34.52 $ 1,656.96 $ 53.76 $ 2,580.48 $ 28.10 $ 1,348.80 $ 27.00 $ 1,296.00 NO BID NO BID $ 43.00 $ 2,064.00 $ 48.99 $ 2,351.52



TRPM Flexible chip and seal markers white

TRPM 4" W-2 WZ Standard 2000 $ 0.83 $ 1,660.00 NO BID NO BID $ 0.60 $ 1,200.00 $ 0.55 $ 1,100.00 NO BID NO BID $ 0.70 $ 1,400.00 NO BID NO BID

TRPM Flexible chip and seal markers yellow

TRPM 4" Y-2 WZ Standard 2000 $ 0.83 $ 1,660.00 NO BID NO BID $ 0.60 $ 1,200.00 $ 0.55 $ 1,100.00 NO BID NO BID $ 0.70 $ 1,400.00 NO BID NO BID

C-42 Channelizer with 4 each x 4" Hi sheeting and Cb-30lb base 20 $ 49.35 $ 987.00 $ 53.98 $ 1,079.60 $ 52.00 $ 1,040.00 $ 50.00 $ 1,000.00 NO BID NO BID $ 52.00 $ 1,040.00 $ 70.06 $ 1,401.20

W14-3 No passing zone 48"x36' black/yellow 10 $ 40.01 $ 400.10 $ 33.98 $ 339.80 $ 41.60 $ 416.00 $ 40.00 $ 400.00 $ 58.40 $ 584.00 $ 44.10 $ 441.00 $ 41.46 $ 414.60

2 holes Sign complete with aluminum

18" Stop/Slow high intensity paddles with 6 ft handle 10 $ 34.76 $ 347.60 $ 81.66 $ 816.60 $ 52.00 $ 520.00 $ 50.00 $ 500.00 $ 47.90 $ 479.00 $ 49.60 $ 496.00 $ 30.74 $ 307.40

36"x36" Roll up Signs Super bright  reflective Orange

One Lane Road 4 $ 100.30 $ 401.20 $ 85.56 $ 342.24 $ 72.80 $ 291.20 $ 70.00 $ 280.00 NO BID NO BID $ 90.50 $ 362.00 $ 101.57 $ 406.28

Fresh Oil 4 $ 100.30 $ 401.20 $ 85.56 $ 342.24 $ 72.80 $ 291.20 $ 70.00 $ 280.00 NO BID NO BID $ 90.50 $ 362.00 $ 101.57 $ 406.28

Flagger Symble 4 $ 100.30 $ 401.20 $ 85.56 $ 342.24 $ 72.80 $ 291.20 $ 70.00 $ 280.00 NO BID NO BID $ 90.50 $ 362.00 $ 101.57 $ 406.28

Road Work Ahead 8 $ 100.30 $ 802.40 $ 85.56 $ 684.48 $ 72.80 $ 582.40 $ 70.00 $ 560.00 NO BID NO BID $ 90.50 $ 724.00 $ 101.57 $ 812.56

Green U Channel Post 7' 1.12 lb/ft 48 $ 19.47 $ 934.56 $ 11.27 $ 540.96 $ 8.35 $ 400.80 $ 8.00 $ 384.00 $ 9.52 $ 456.96 $ 11.95 $ 573.60 $ 13.73 $ 659.04

Green U Channel Post 10' 2 lb/ft 48 $ 23.14 $ 1,110.72 $ 28.51 $ 1,368.48 $ 18.75 $ 900.00 $ 18.00 $ 864.00 $ 21.69 $ 1,041.12 $ 30.00 $ 1,440.00 $ 32.70 $ 1,569.60

Green U Channel Post 12' 2lb/ft 48 $ 30.00 $ 1,440.00 $ 34.20 $ 1,641.60 $ 22.90 $ 1,099.20 $ 22.00 $ 1,056.00 $ 26.03 $ 1,249.44 $ 36.00 $ 1,728.00 $ 39.23 $ 1,883.04

5/16" set screws stainless steel SS-516 400 $ 0.18 $ 72.00 NO BID NO BID 4 Pkg $ 20.80 $ 83.20 4 Pkg $ 20.00 $ 80.00 NO BID NO BID $ 0.12 $ 48.00 $ 0.25 $ 100.00
Poly Sand bags 500 $ 0.48 $ 240.00 NO BID NO BID 5 Bdl $ 25.00 $ 125.00 5 Bdl $ 24.00 $ 120.00 NO BID NO BID $ 0.80 $ 400.00 NO BID NO BID
12"x50 yds Green Electrocut 2 roll $ 191.22 $ 382.44 NO BID NO BID $ 188.25 $ 376.50 $ 181.00 $ 362.00 4 roll $ 157.50 $ 630.00 $ 175.50 $ 351.00 $ 135.00 $ 270.00
12"x50 yds Black Electrocut 2 roll $ 191.22 $ 382.44 NO BID NO BID $ 197.60 $ 395.20 $ 190.00 $ 380.00 4 roll $ 157.50 $ 630.00 $ 175.50 $ 351.00 $ 135.00 $ 270.00
12"x100 yds Clear Transfer Tape 2 roll $ 115.12 $ 230.24 $ 203.72 $ 407.44 $ 119.60 $ 239.20 $ 115.00 $ 230.00 4 roll $ 78.00 $ 312.00 $ 138.00 $ 276.00 $ 120.00 $ 240.00
 TPM5 ECF
9"x50 yds White High Intensity prizmatic 4 roll $ 180.00 $ 720.00 $ 261.11 $ 1,044.44 $ 156.00 $ 624.00 $ 150.00 $ 600.00 $ 128.25 $ 513.00 $ 154.12 $ 616.48 $ 158.63 $ 634.52
12"x50 yds White High Intensity prizmatic 1 roll $ 255.00 $ 255.00 $ 348.15 $ 348.15 $ 208.00 $ 208.00 $ 200.00 $ 200.00 $ 171.00 $ 171.00 $ 205.50 $ 205.50 $ 211.50 $ 211.50

9"x50 yds Yellow High Intensity prizmatic 1 roll $ 180.00 $ 180.00 NO BID NO BID 2 rolls $ 156.00 $ 312.00 2 rolls $ 150.00 $ 300.00 6 roll $ 128.25 $ 769.50 $ 154.12 $ 154.12 $ 158.63 $ 158.63
12"x50 yds Yellow Engineer grade 1 roll $ 650.00 $ 650.00 NO BID NO BID $ 166.40 $ 166.40 $ 160.00 $ 160.00 $ 171.00 $ 171.00 $ 205.50 $ 205.50 $ 165.00 $ 165.00

Replacement Pannels Barricade Orange/White
8ft x1"x8" Plastic High Intensity Double Face 21 $ 60.00 $ 1,260.00 $ 64.22 $ 1,348.62 $ 34.35 $ 721.35 $ 33.00 $ 693.00 NO BID NO BID $ 49.60 $ 1,041.60 $ 54.08 $ 1,135.68

Temporary Pavement Tape #3034 10 roll $ 56.32 $ 563.20 NO BID NO BID $ 57.20 $ 572.00 $ 55.00 $ 550.00 NO BID NO BID $ 51.00 $ 510.00 $ 70.00 $ 700.00
Yellow 4"x50 yds Construction grade

Triangular markers Guardrail reflectors double sided 400 $ 4.96 $ 1,984.00 NO BID NO BID $ 3.15 $ 1,260.00 $ 3.00 $ 1,200.00 NO BID NO BID $ 1.95 $ 780.00 $ 4.79 $ 1,916.00
high intensity white reflectgor bolt-on, butter fly plastic

Solar Barricade Flashers Amber 10 $ 96.10 $ 961.00 $ 42.42 $ 424.20 $ 51.00 $ 510.00 $ 49.00 $ 490.00 NO BID NO BID $ 39.50 $ 395.00 $ 64.08 $ 640.80

24" Type 2 Barricades Double Faced High Intensity 14 $ 83.33 $ 1,166.62 $ 65.74 $ 920.36 $ 104.00 $ 1,456.00 $ 100.00 $ 1,400.00 NO BID NO BID $ 74.50 $ 1,043.00 $ 90.04 $ 1,260.56
Orange and White Plastic

Orange 36" Double reflective collars 4" and 6" 10lb base 24 $ 26.63 $ 639.12 $ 24.22 $ 581.28 $ 20.80 $ 499.20 $ 20.00 $ 480.00 NO BID NO BID $ 31.50 $ 756.00 $ 43.87 $ 1,052.88

Wide Body Cone

3/8" x 1-12" outside dia. Nylon washer 600 $ 0.38 $ 228.00 NO BID NO BID 6 Pkg $ 37.45 $ 224.70 6 Pkg $ 36.00 $ 216.00 NO BID NO BID $ 0.80 $ 480.00 $ 2.06 $ 1,236.00
R11-2 Road Closed black/white 48"x30" 6 $ 67.08 $ 402.48 $ 52.28 $ 313.68 $ 68.65 $ 411.90 $ 66.00 $ 396.00 $ 62.30 $ 373.80 $ 63.00 $ 378.00 $ 64.10 $ 384.60

TOTAL OF
ALL PAGES $ 36,634.66 $ 29,195.81 $ 30,584.95 $ 29,249.62 $ 16,826.18 $ 32,636.60 $ 33,698.28
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